12/29/22, 12:15 PM UIN Raden Mas Said Surakarta Mail - can | use other payment methods?

= Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

can | use other payment methods?
9 messages

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Sun, Sep 11, 2022 at 5:12 AM

To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

Thank you for your response. but I'm having payment problems, can | use other payment methods?

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Mon, Sep 12, 2022 at 8:46 AM

To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>
Muhammad,
Thank you for your email. Our other payment method includes PayPal, where you can pay online using your card,

and bank transfers. Please let us know which one works best for you.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice
North American Business Press

[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Mon, Sep 12, 2022 at 10:30 AM

To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>
Thank you for your response.

[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Mon, Sep 12, 2022 at 12:45 PM

To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>
what is the pay pal account number or account for money transfer?

On Mon, Sep 12, 2022 at 8:46 AM JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Mon, Sep 12, 2022 at 7:14 PM

To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>
Muhammad,

Thank you for your response. We will send you a PayPal link for your subscription. Kindly standby for our next email.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar-979819142849109995&simpl=msg-a%3Ar-1341...
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MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor
Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice

North American Business Press
[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Mon, Sep 12, 2022 at 8:41 PM
To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

Ok, thank you.
[Quoted text hidden]

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Tue, Sep 13, 2022 at 7:12 PM
To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

Muhammad,

You may now process your subscription using the link below. If you have any questions, please let me know. Have
a great day ahead!

https://www.paypal.com/invoice/p/#HLN5LERL5X85MTFU

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice
North American Business Press

[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Tue, Sep 13, 2022 at 9:00 PM
To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

Thank you for your help!

[Quoted text hidden]
JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Wed, Sep 14, 2022 at 7:00 PM
To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

Muhammad,

Thank you. | acknowledge receipt of both your formatted manuscript and payment. Please give us some time to

review if your manuscript has met all formatting guidelines. Kindly standby your email for the following days so we
can confirm any clarifications or concerns.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel
MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar-979819142849109995&simpl=msg-a%3Ar-1341...  2/3
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Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice

North American Business Press
[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar-979819142849109995&simpl=msg-a%3Ar-1341...  3/3
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Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

JHETP 22(15), 2022 Corrections

6 messages

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Tue, Oct 18, 2022 at 8:00 PM
To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

Muhammad,

| hope you are doing well. | would like to inform you that your manuscript has reached the final production stage. We
have attached the manuscript for review. We request that you review your manuscript for any minor mistakes.

We will be accepting any minor changes until October 23, 2022. If we receive no confirmation from your end by the
mentioned date, we will consider this a go signal to publish the sent manuscript to avoid delays.

Should you have any other questions, feel free to let me know. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice

North American Business Press

ﬂ 10 MunadiFinal.pdf
296K

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Wed, Oct 19, 2022 at 4:59 AM
To: munadimahdiputra@gmail.com

[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ 10 MunadiFinal.pdf
296K

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Wed, Oct 19, 2022 at 5:01 AM
To: aisyah76@gmail.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

Date: Tue, Oct 18, 2022 at 8:01 PM

Subject: JHETP 22(15), 2022 Corrections

To: Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ 10 MunadiFinal.pdf
296K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1747030502123740572&simpl=msg-f%3A1747030... 1/2
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Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Sun, Oct 23, 2022 at 4:48 PM
To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

Our article has no correction. Thanks
[Quoted text hidden]

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Mon, Oct 24, 2022 at 10:01 AM
To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

Muhammad,

Thank you for the confirmation. Please feel free to contact us for further assistance.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice
North American Business Press

[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Mon, Oct 24, 2022 at 3:44 PM
To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

You are welcome.
[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1747030502123740572&simpl=msg-f%3A1747030... 2/2
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JHETP Acceptance

8 messages

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Wed, Sep 7, 2022 at 8:00 PM

To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>
Muhammad,
Congratulations! After rounds of rigorous reviews, we would like to inform you that your manuscript has been
accepted for publication in the Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice. Please see attached acceptance

letter which contains all important information regarding the next steps.

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact us. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice

North American Business Press

ﬂ Munadi_Acceptance Letter.pdf
252K

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Thu, Sep 8, 2022 at 6:15 AM

To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

| accept!
[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Thu, Sep 8, 2022 at 6:17 AM

To: aisyah76@gmail.com, muh.munadi@staff.uinsaid.ac.id

[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ Munadi_Acceptance Letter.pdf
252K

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Thu, Sep 8, 2022 at 8:56 AM

To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>
Muhammad,

Thank you for the positive response. We have just emailed you the author agreement contract. Kindly sign it. We will
send the invoice to you from authorize.net.

Moreover, attached are the formatting guidelines; if you have not yet formatted your paper according to our policies,
kindly follow the instructions. Otherwise, no further action is needed for your paper. If you are to make changes, kindly
note that we require a deadline of 2 weeks. Should you need more time, let us know, and we will make adjustments.

In alignment with our author assistance program, we provide support to our authors that need help in editing,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1743315999264 1497 19&simpl=msg-f%3A1743315...

13



12/29/22, 12:15 PM UIN Raden Mas Said Surakarta Mail - JHETP Acceptance

proofreading, and formatting their manuscripts. Currently, we offer formatting services for only $50. Please let us
know if you wish to avail of this service. We will forward you to the correct department.

Once we receive your formatted manuscript, please give us time to review your manuscript in terms of the format.
Kindly expect an email should we require changes and clarifications.

Should you have questions, please let us know. We’'d be glad to assist you.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice

North American Business Press
[Quoted text hidden]

.D JHETP_Formatting Guidelines.pdf
214K

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Thu, Sep 8, 2022 at 10:37 AM
To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

| haven't got the author's agreement contract, how do we get it?
[Quoted text hidden]

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Thu, Sep 8, 2022 at 7:17 PM
To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

Muhammad,

The agreement was sent from third-party software. Kindly double-check. Thank you!

JHETP_AAPA V1.pdf
In Process
To: Muhammad Munadi

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice

North American Business Press

[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Thu, Sep 8, 2022 at 7:49 PM
To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1743315999264 1497 19&simpl=msg-f%3A1743315... 2/3
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&) JHETP_AAPA_V1 sign.pdf
169K

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Fri, Sep 9, 2022 at 6:48 PM
To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>
Muhammad,

This is well received. Thank you very much!

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice
North American Business Press

[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1743315999264 1497 19&simpl=msg-f%3A1743315... 3/3



12/29/22, 12:14 PM UIN Raden Mas Said Surakarta Mail - Manuscript Review Update

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

Manuscript Review Update
4 messages

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Thu, Aug 25, 2022 at 10:16 AM
To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

Muhammad,

| hope you are doing well. | would like to inform you that the review process with the Journal of Higher Education
Theory and Practice has been completed. After rounds of rigorous reviews, we would like to inform you that your
manuscript has been accepted with revisions.

The editors require that you further edit and proofread your manuscript to address grammatical and writing errors
before proceeding to the next step. Once your manuscript is ready, kindly send us a copy so we can assess it. Once
your manuscript has passed the quality check for grammatical errors, we will provide you with the acceptance letter.

Please let us know if you need any assistance with editing and proofreading. | can forward you to the Author
Assistance Program Department.

Thank you very much. Please feel free to reach out to me with any concerns.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice

North American Business Press

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Wed, Aug 31, 2022 at 5:45 AM
To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

| sent the manuscript that | have tried to revise. Thanks.
[Quoted text hidden]

@ Article Muhammad Munadi JHETP Proofread.doc
249K

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Wed, Aug 31, 2022 at 8:35 AM
To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

Muhammad,
Thank you for the attachment. This has been forwarded to the Editor for review. If you have any questions, please let

me know.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel
MBA for...

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1742101439915312391&simpl=msg-f%3A1742101... 1/2
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Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice

North American Business Press
[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Wed, Aug 31, 2022 at 10:33 AM
To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

thank.

On Wed, Aug 31, 2022 at 10:32 AM Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1742101439915312391&simpl=msg-f%3A1742101... 2/2
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= Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>

submit a manuscript
3 messages

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 8:08 AM

To: jhetp@nabpress.com
Bcc: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>, munadimahdiputra@gmail.com

Dear Editor,

I am submitting a manuscript for consideration of publication in Journal of Higher Education
Theory and Pracitice. The manuscript is entitled “Internal Audit Management in Islamic Higher
Education: An Effort to Minimize The Potential of Audit Findings”. It has not been published

elsewhere and that it has not been submitted simultaneously for publication elsewhere.
Thank you very much for your consideration.

Yours Sincerely,

Muhammad Munadi

Universitas Islam Negeri Raden Mas Said Surakarta
J1. Pandawa, Pucangan, Kartasura, Indonesia 57168
Tel.: (+6271) 781516 Mobilephone +6281217101344
E-mail: muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id

@ Article Muhammad Munadi JHETP .doc
241K

JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com> Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 9:21 AM

To: "Muh. Munadi, M.Pd" <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id>
Muhammad,
This is to inform you that your manuscript has been officially processed with the North American Business Press for
review.
Your manuscript reference number is JHETP 1.993. The review process takes around 20 days. We will reach out to
you once your manuscript has completed this step.
Please email us your manuscript reference number if you have any questions regarding the review.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sunila Luitel

MBA for...

Dr. Donald Smith, Editor

Journal of Higher Education Theory and Practice
North American Business Press

[Quoted text hidden]

Muh. Munadi, M.Pd <muh.munadi@iain-surakarta.ac.id> Wed, Aug 3, 2022 at 1:15 PM

To: JHETP <jhetp@nabpress.com>

Thank you for your response.
[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6ce9ac384a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar-150216821350505677 &simpl=msg-a%3Ar-1535...
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